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ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT
P. O. Box 170

Port Allen, Louisiana 70767-0170

Phone (225) 387-2249

Fax    (225) 387-4742







June 5, 2019





A Regular Board Meeting of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held at the Office of the Board in Port Allen, Louisiana at 4:00 pm, Wednesday, 
June 5, 2019.  President John Grezaffi called the meeting to order and declared a quorum. The following members were present:

COMMISSIONER


PARISH

Bill Flynn



West Baton Rouge
Kenneth Gordon


West Baton Rouge

Mark Guillory


St. Landry
John Grezaffi


Pointe Coupee

Spencer Harvey


Ascension

Daniel Hebert


Iberville

Karen Jewell


Iberville

Moise LeBlanc


St. Martin



Harry Marionneaux


Iberville 

Earl Matherne


Assumption

Sean McGee



Iberia
Absent: 

Jody Meche



St. Martin

Nickie Rockforte


Pointe Coupee

Also Present:

INDIVIDUAL


REPRESENTING

Tony German


CPRA

Breana Smith


Westside Journal

William Tyson


Executive Director

Nicholas Rockforte


Levee Board Attorney

Richard 
Sparks


Levee Board Superintendent





Janice Jarreau


Administrative Program Manager
Crissi Canezaro


Administrative Program Specialist
Tiffany Weber


Administrative Program Specialist 
Kristy Jewell


Human Resource Analyst

                                                                    * * * * 
President John Grezaffi asked for public comments.  Hearing none, he proceeded with the agenda.  

                                                                    * * * * 
After review, Commissioner Earl Matherne moved, seconded by Commissioner Karen Jewell and unanimously carried to approve the minutes of the May 1, 2019 board meeting as presented, and to publish the minutes in the official journal.  
                                                                    * * * * 
Mr. Will Tyson advised the board that the water is at 43’ in Baton Rouge and will go to 44.5’ by June 16th.  However, the Corps of Engineers has decreased their projections for a further rise.  The Corps of Engineers is scheduled to open the Morganza Spillway on Sunday June 9th at 1:00 pm.  They will start by opening two gates at 50%.  President John Grezaffi said we have a lot of slides because the water has been for so long.  The Corps has done some work with stone to repair them.  
                                                                    * * * * 
Mr. Tony German of CPRA was recognized.  He said after the Morganza Spillway is opened on Sunday and they will be organizing to take care of any emergencies that occur.  

                                                                    * * * * 
                                                                   NOTICE

Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners, Atchafalaya Basin 

Levee District, in its Office in Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 5, 2019 

and can also be submitted online at www.centralauctionhouse.com for:

(1)

Furnishing Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered at designated locations

within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months

beginning July 1, 2019 and ending June 30, 2020.

(2)

Furnishing Crushed Limestone delivered at designated locations within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months beginning July 1, 2019 and ending June 30, 2020.

All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid

received after 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.

The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.

Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked





 “BID – FUEL” or “BID - AGGREGATES.”
Specifications, proposal forms, etc., are available at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee 

District Office, (525 Court Street) P. O. Box 170, Port Allen, Louisiana 70767, telephone

number (225) 387-2249.

Janice G. Jarreau





John Grezaffi

Secretary






            President

3t  Daily Journal of Commerce, The Advocate, Plaquemine Post South, and Pointe Coupee Banner     May 16, 23, and 30, 2019

The following bids were duly opened and read:

ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT

TABULATION OF BIDS

Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered at designated locations within the District in quantities as requested for one year beginning July 1, 2019 and ending June 30, 2020.

	Unleaded Fuel
	Steven Dupuis Oil 
	Richard’s

Oil 
	Morel

Lemoine
	Sun Coast Resources
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 1 Ravenswood
	.35
	.1249
	.135
	.1396
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 2

Ravenswood
	.35
	.1249
	.135
	.1396
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 3 

Maringouin
	.30
	.1299
	.135
	.1634
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 4

Henderson
	.25
	.3599
	.16
	.1785
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 5 

Stephensville
	.35
	.299
	.45
	.1785
	
	


Commissioner Earl Matherne moved, seconded by Commissioner Kenneth Gordon and unanimously carried to take the bids under advisement.
The following bids were duly opened and read:

 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT

TABULATION OF BIDS

Wednesday, June 5, 2019

DESCRIPTION
	Name of Bidder
	Luhr Bros. d/b/a

Construction Aggregates
	Bear Industries
	Slats Lucas

Aggregates
	Acadiana 

Shell
	Moreau’s 

Material Yard
	
	

	ITEM #1

Crushed 

Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$37.00
	Amount per ton

$35.10
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$33.00
	Amount per ton

$34.00
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #2

Crushed Limestone(#610)
	Amount per ton

$34.50
	Amount per ton

$34.10
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$31.00
	Amount per ton

$33.00


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #3

Crushed Limestone(#57)
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$26.00
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #4

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$26.40
	Amount per ton

$27.50
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #5

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$39.90


	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton

$36.50


	Amount per ton

$38.75


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #6

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$46.00
	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton

 NO BID


	Amount per ton

$46.50
	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #7

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$39.90
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$32.75
	Amount per ton

$41.20
	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #8

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$39.90
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$41.00
	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #9

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$39.90
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$36.90
	Amount per ton

$38.25


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #10

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

 $39.90
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$35.50
	Amount per ton

$36.00


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #11

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$39.90


	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton

$37.50


	Amount per ton

$41.70


	Amount per ton

NO BID


	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM # 12

Crushed 

Limestone (#57)
	Amount per ton

$39.90
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$41.00
	Amount per ton

$39.00
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #13

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

$25.00
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton

	ITEM #14

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	Amount per ton

$22.90
	Amount per ton

$26.50
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton

NO BID
	Amount per ton


	Amount per ton


Commissioner Earl Matherne moved, seconded by Commissioner Kenneth Gordon and unanimously carried to take the bids under advisement.

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

OFFICIAL JOURNAL


Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District, at 525 Court Street, Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June  5, 2019, for printing and publication of minutes of meetings of the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District and all other legal advertisements required by law for a period of one (1) year.  


All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid received subsequent to 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.


The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.


Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked “BID - OFFICIAL JOURNAL.”

Janice G. Jarreau




 John Grezaffi

Secretary





 President

3t

Pointe Coupee Banner, Plaquemine Post South and West Side Journal

May 16, 23 and 30, 2019.

The following bid was duly opened and read:

Pointe Coupee Banner - $2.90 per square inch.

Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Sean McGee and unanimously carried to accept the bid from Pointe Coupee Banner.

                                                                    * * * * 
A meeting of the Insurance/Finance Committee of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held at 4:00 p.m., Wednesday, May 29, 2019, at the Board Office in Port Allen, Louisiana.  Chairman Daniel Hebert called the meeting to order.

The following members were present:

Daniel Hebert, Chairman

Earl Matherne, 1st Vice Chairman

Moise LeBlanc, Member

Karen Jewell, Member

Bill Flynn, Ex-Officio Chairman

Absent:

John Grezaffi, Ex-Officio Chairman

Also Present:

Commissioner Harry Marionneaux

Commissioner Spencer Harvey

Commissioner Mark Guillory

William Tyson, Executive Director

Kristy Jewell, Human Resources Analyst

Tiffany Weber, Administrative Program Specialist

Crissi Canezaro, Administrative Program Specialist

1.  Amend 2018 – 2019 Budget:  Mr. Will Tyson presented a copy of the 2018-2019 Budget and proposed several changes to bring the budget in line with the actual figures this year.  These changes included increasing several income categories and decreasing others so that Total Income was amended from $7,642,833 to $7,863,400.  When reviewing changes under Expenses, he noted our overtime has been increased due to record high water levels on the levees along with 24 hour a day requirements to operate relief well

pumps since November.  Travel, Professional Services, Insurance, Levee Maintenance, Administrative Office and  Other Expenditures were decreased.  Capital Outlay, Maintenance Facilities and Ad Valorem Tax Collection were increased.  The net change in expenses was from $7,491,888 to $8,054,165.  Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Moise LeBlanc and unanimously carried to approve the revised budget for 2018-2019 as amended.  

2.  Adopt 2019-2020 Budget:  Mr. Tyson presented a proposed budget for 2019-2020 for the committee’s consideration.  He said this budget mirrors our actual numbers from this year.  He noted that 75% of the overtime spent during this year for flooding and high water on the levees will be submitted to FEMA for reimbursement.  Commissioner Bill Flynn moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne and unanimously carried to approve the proposed budget for 2019-2020 as presented.  

There being no further business to come before the committee, upon motion by Commissioner Earl Matherne and unanimously carried the meeting adjourned.  

Respectfully submitted, 

/s/Daniel Hebert, Chairman


          /s/Earl Matherne, 1st Vice Chairman

/s/Karen Jewell, Member
                                /s/ Moise LeBlanc, Member

/s/Bill Flynn, Chairman

Commissioner Earl Matherne moved, seconded by Commissioner Daniel Hebert and unanimously carried to increase the total for Overtime to $37,000 per revised figures from Mr. Will Tyson.  Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne and unanimously carried to approve the amended minutes as presented.  

                                                                    * * * * 
Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Harry Marionneaux and unanimously carried to authorize the staff to obtain quotes for employee uniforms.

Commissioner Harry Marionneaux moved, seconded by Commissioner Mark Guillory and unanimously carried to approve permanent status for Mr. Mervin Hebert.

                                                                    * * * * 
Mr. Nicholas Rockforte advised the board that he is still waiting for the decision from the First Circuit Court of Appeals relative to the bike paths.  He said they may not decide until this fall or winter.

                                                                    * * * * 
President John Grezaffi said he met with Wildlife & Fisheries Agents relative to their need to stop people from entering the spillway or riding the levees.  They gave people permission to check their camps or cattle, and we gave the agents names of people in Pointe Coupee and Iberville Parishes who are landowners or work in that area.  

                                                                    * * * * 
There being no further business to come before the board, upon motion by Commissioner Harry Marionneaux and unanimously carried the meeting adjourned.
____________________________________           ____________________________________

Janice Jarreau, Secretary


           John Grezaffi, President

____________________________________

Linda Alwood, Contract Stenographer 
An Equal Opportunity Employer

